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SUMMARY — CASE C-169/07 

needs of the market for setting up independent outpatient dental clinics — Not permissible —
Justification by reason of the general interest — None 

(Arts 43 EC and 48 EC) 

Articles 43 EC and 48 EC preclude national
legislation under which authorisation is 
necessary for the setting up of a private 
health institution in the form of an inde-
pendent outpatient dental clinic, and author-
isation must be refused if there is no need for 
that outpatient clinic, having regard to the 
care already offered by contractual practi-
tioners, where that legislation does not also
subject group practices to such a system and is
not based on a condition capable of 
adequately circumscribing the exercise by 
the national authorities of their discretion. 

Such legislation is not appropriate for 
ensuring attainment of the objectives of 
maintaining a balanced high-quality medical
service open to all and preventing the risk of
serious harm to the financial balance of the 
social security system. First, that legislation
does not pursue the stated objectives in a 
consistent and systematic manner, since it 
does not make the setting up of group
practices subject to a system of prior author-
isation, as is the case with new outpatient 

dental clinics, even though group practices
generally offer the same medical services as
outpatient dental clinics, they are subject to
the same market conditions, and in many
cases the patient will not notice any difference
between them. Second, if a prior adminis-
trative authorisation scheme is to be justified
even though it derogates from a fundamental
freedom, it must be based on objective, non-
discriminatory criteria known in advance, in
such a way as adequately to circumscribe the
exercise of the national authorities’ discretion. 
That is not the case if the issue of authorisa-
tion to set up a new outpatient dental clinic is
subject to the criterion of the number of 
patients per doctor, which is not fixed or 
brought in advance to the notice of the 
persons concerned in any way, or if the prior
administrative authorisation scheme is based 
on a method which is liable to affect the 
objectivity and impartiality of the treatment of
the application for authorisation. 

(see paras 57, 58, 63-66, 68-72, operative part) 
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